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Abstract	

At	present,	 the	 special	 struggle	 to	 eradicate	 gangsters	 and	 evils	 is	being	 carried	out	
across	the	country.	The	Party	Central	Committee	with	Comrade	Xi	Jinping	at	its	core	is	
making	major	decisions	and	deployments	based	on	 the	 situation	and	 foresight	at	an	
important	node	in	the	comprehensive	decisive	battle	for	a	well‐off	society	and	the	great	
rejuvenation	of	the	Chinese	nation,	which	is	related	to	society.	The	stability	of	the	overall	
situation	and	 the	 long‐term	 stability	of	 the	 country	are	 related	 to	 the	 support	of	 the	
people	 and	 the	 consolidation	 of	 the	 grassroots	 political	 power,	 and	 it	 is	 related	 to	
whether	 the	 "Four	 Greats"	 can	 be	 carried	 out	 smoothly.	 As	 a	Marxist	 researcher	 in	
colleges	and	universities	and	a	practitioner	of	ideological	and	political	work,	we	should	
look	at	the	overall	situation,	both	inside	and	outside,	and	from	the	perspective	of	reality	
and	 theory,	 to	 understand	 and	 grasp	 the	 background	 of	 the	 times	when	 the	 central	
government	launched	the	special	campaign	to	eliminate	crime;	To	explore	and	excavate	
the	 value	 connotation	of	 the	 central	 government's	 special	 struggle	against	 crime;	To	
deeply	 understand	 the	 decision	 intention	 of	 the	 Central	 Committee	 to	 carry	 out	 the	
special	struggle	against	crime	and	evil,	and	ultimately	enable	us	to	better	strengthen	the	
"two	safeguards"	and	to	forge	a	new	era	of	socialism	with	Chinese	characteristics,	so	as	
to	continue	to	struggle	for	the	realization	of	the	Chinese	Dream	of	the	great	rejuvenation	
of	the	Chinese	nation.	
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1. Introduction	

Carrying	 out	 the	 three‐year	 special	 campaign	 to	 eradicate	 crime	 is	 a	 major	 decision	 and	
deployment	made	by	the	Central	Committee	recently.	It	is	related	to	the	long‐term	stability	of	
the	country,	the	Party	spirit	and	the	people,	the	cause	of	socialism	with	Chinese	characteristics,	
and	the	smooth	realization	of	the	Chinese	Dream	of	the	great	rejuvenation	of	the	Chinese	nation.	
As	 a	 Marxist	 researcher	 in	 colleges	 and	 universities	 and	 a	 practitioner	 of	 ideological	 and	
political	work,	we	should	look	at	the	overall	situation,	both	inside	and	outside,	and	from	the	
perspective	of	reality	and	theory,	to	understand	and	grasp	the	background	of	the	times	when	
the	 central	 government	 launched	 the	 special	 campaign	 to	 eliminate	 crime;	 To	 explore	 and	
excavate	the	value	connotation	of	the	central	government's	special	struggle	against	crime;	To	
deeply	 understand	 the	decision	 intention	 of	 the	Central	 Committee	 to	 carry	 out	 the	 special	
struggle	against	crime	and	evil,	so	that	we	can	better	strengthen	the	"two	safeguards"	and	forge	
a	new	era	of	socialism	with	Chinese	characteristics,	and	continue	to	strive	to	realize	the	Chinese	
Dream	of	the	great	rejuvenation	of	the	Chinese	nation.	
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2. The	Central	Committee	Made	the	Decision	and	Deployment	of	A	Three‐
year	Special	Fight	Against	Crime	

The	eradication	of	criminal	syndicates	should	be	combined	with	the	fight	against	corruption,	
and	with	the	grassroots	"beating	ropes".	We	should	not	only	focus	on	organizations	involved	in	
criminal	syndicates,	but	also	on	the	"umbrella"	behind	them.	Strengthening	the	construction	of	
grass‐roots	organizations	 is	a	 fundamental	policy	and	a	key	move	to	eradicate	 the	breeding	
ground	of	evil	forces.	We	must	firmly	consolidate	this	foundation.	
On	January	23,	2018,	the	Central	Political	and	Legal	Commission	held	a	teleconference	on	the	
national	anti	mafia	 campaign;	 In	 the	same	month,	 the	Central	Committee	of	 the	Communist	
Party	of	China	and	the	State	Council	issued	the	Notice	on	Carrying	out	the	Special	Fight	against	
Mafia.	All	regions	and	departments	should	further	improve	their	political	standing,	effectively	
strengthen	the	"four	senses",	fully	understand	the	significance	of	carrying	out	the	special	fight	
against	organized	crime,	effectively	integrate	their	thoughts	and	actions	into	the	deployment	of	
the	Party	Central	Committee,	scientifically	plan,	carefully	organize,	and	carefully	 implement,	
and	resolutely	win	the	crucial	battle	of	the	special	fight	against	organized	crime.	
At	this	point,	the	national	special	campaign	against	crime	officially	kicked	off.	
The	special	fight	against	organized	crime	lasts	for	three	years	and	is	divided	into	three	stages	
to	achieve	the	goals	of	one	year's	temporary	cure,	two	years'	root	cause	cure	and	three	years'	
root	cause	cure.	
The	main	tasks	of	the	first	stage:	in	2018,	a	new	climax	of	the	special	campaign	against	crime	
will	 be	 set	 off,	 the	 overall	 effectiveness	 of	 the	 special	 campaign	 against	 crime	 will	 be	
significantly	 improved,	 and	 the	 outstanding	 problems	 of	 crime	 will	 be	 effectively	 curbed,	
forming	a	strong	atmosphere	of	anti	crime;	
The	main	tasks	of	the	second	stage:	In	2019,	we	will	focus	on	tackling	key	cases,	key	problems	
and	key	areas	that	have	not	yet	been	solved,	dig	deeply	into	the	detected	cases	along	the	line	
and	see	the	bottom	one	by	one,	thoroughly	eradicate	the	soil	on	which	the	mafia	forces	grow,	
and	significantly	improve	the	people's	sense	of	security	and	satisfaction;	
The	main	task	of	the	third	stage:	By	2020,	establish	and	improve	a	 long‐term	mechanism	to	
curb	the	growth	and	spread	of	the	underworld	forces,	and	achieve	an	overwhelming	victory	in	
the	special	fight	against	underworld.	
The	Central	Committee	has	made	the	decision	and	deployment	of	a	three‐year	special	campaign	
to	eradicate	crime,	echoing	the	reality,	the	mission	and	the	times.	It	has	a	far‐reaching	vision	
and	is	of	great	significance.	

3. Realistic	Logic,	The	Superposition	of	Internal	and	External	Factors	
Highlights	the	Necessity	and	Urgency	of	Eliminating	Crime	

3.1. The	strategic	turn,	the	western	hostile	forces	led	by	the	United	States	
comprehensively	suppressed	and	contained	China	by	all	means,	and	the	
external	environment	for	China's	peaceful	development	was	deteriorating	
day	by	day.	

Because	of	the	strategic	misjudgment	of	the	United	States	on	China's	development	speed	and	
capability	and	the	sudden	occurrence	of	the	911	incident,	the	United	States	has	lost	the	best	
window	period	for	its	strategic	containment	of	China	subjectively	and	objectively.	
The	US	government's	strategic	misjudgment	of	China's	development	speed	and	capacity	lags	
behind	 the	 start	 time	 of	 the	 US's	 comprehensive	 strategic	 suppression	 of	 China,	 leaving	 a	
relatively	ample	window	for	China's	peaceful	and	stable	development.	From	the	late	1990s	to	
the	early	2000s,	Brzezinski,	a	former	national	security	adviser	and	famous	geostrategic	theorist	
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of	the	United	States,	pointed	out	in	the	book	"The	Big	Chess	Board"	published	in	1997	that	"in	
general,	even	by	2020,	even	under	the	best	conditions,	China	is	unlikely	to	be	truly	competitive	
in	the	main	aspects	of	a	global	power."	According	to	the	global	trend	report	released	by	the	
National	Intelligence	Commission	of	the	United	States	in	2004,	It	is	predicted	that	China	may	
become	the	second	largest	economy	in	the	world	by	2020.	In	fact,	it	took	only	six	years	for	China	
to	overtake	Japan	and	become	the	world's	second	largest	economy	‐	a	full	decade	ahead	of	the	
prediction	of	the	National	Intelligence	Commission	of	the	United	States.	But	in	2011,	Brzezinski	
corrected	his	misjudgment	in	his	new	book	Strategic	Vision	‐	The	United	States	and	the	Global	
Power	Crisis:	 "With	 the	 development	 of	 China's	 economic	 and	 political	 strength,	 China	will	
challenge	the	global	leadership	of	the	United	States	in	the	future.	Considering	China's	recent	
performance	and	historical	achievements,	the	idea	that	China's	economy	will	suddenly	stop	is	
hasty."	Since	the	reform	and	opening	up,	under	the	leadership	of	the	Party	Central	Committee,	
China	takes	economic	construction	as	the	center,	works	hard	and	devotes	itself	to	development;	
We	adopted	the	foreign	policy	of	"keeping	a	low	profile",	abandoned	the	principle	of	drawing	a	
line	with	ideology	and	social	system,	and	won	a	relatively	loose	international	environment	for	
ourselves	with	a	pragmatic	diplomatic	concept	and	an	overall	open	attitude.	
The	 sudden	 911	 incident	 upset	 the	 rhythm	 of	 the	 US	 government's	 containment	 of	 China,	
forcing	 its	 strategic	 focus	 to	 comprehensively	 turn	 to	 global	 anti‐terrorism,	 and	 its	 policy	
towards	China	 to	 turn	 from	 confrontation	 to	 cooperation.	 In	 the	 field	 of	 anti‐terrorism,	 the	
United	States	urgently	needs	China's	support	and	cooperation,	which	makes	the	United	States	
have	 to	give	up	confrontation	and	adopt	a	 cooperative	attitude	on	 some	 issues.	 In	 the	 fight	
against	 terrorism,	 China	 and	 the	 United	 States	 share	 common	 interests	 and	 goals;	 In	 the	
economic	 field,	 the	 United	 States	 also	 urgently	 needs	 to	 eliminate	 the	 impact	 of	 economic	
recession	caused	by	terrorism.	As	an	important	new	engine	of	world	economic	development,	
China	can	work	together	with	the	United	States	to	complement	each	other's	advantages	and	
play	the	role	of	"ballast"	and	"stabilizer".	Strengthening	economic	cooperation	with	China	is	the	
best	option	for	the	United	States	to	curb	recession	and	boost	the	economy.	The	September	11	
incident	 prompted	 the	 United	 States	 to	 make	major	 adjustments	 to	 its	 China	 policy.	 From	
"strategic	 opponents"	 to	 "stakeholders"	 to	 "building	 a	 cooperative	 partnership	 of	 mutual	
respect,	mutual	benefit	and	win‐win	results",	the	three	stages	of	adjustment	coincided	with	the	
first	 decade	 of	 the	 21st	 century.	 This	 decade	 has	 witnessed	 steady	 progress	 in	 China	 US	
relations,	remarkable	achievements	in	China's	multilateral	cooperation,	rapid	development	of	
China's	economy,	and	a	decade	in	which	the	United	States	and	the	Communist	Party,	the	United	
States	 and	 the	 United	 States,	 and	 win‐win	 cooperation	 have	 replaced	 confrontation	 as	 the	
mainstream.	
After	30	years	of	sustained,	high‐speed,	healthy	and	stable	development	of	reform	and	opening	
up,	China	has	grown	into	the	world's	second	largest	economy	and	the	world's	first	industrial	
manufacturing	country.	Its	comprehensive	national	strength	has	begun	to	show	itself.	"China's	
speed"	has	amazed	the	world,	and	"China's	miracle"	has	been	constantly	performed.	In	the	eyes	
of	hegemonists	and	unilateralists,	the	identity	of	the	second	largest	economy,	the	"the	Belt	and	
Road"	initiative,	and	the	idea	of	building	a	"community	with	a	shared	future	for	mankind"	all	
challenge	the	values	and	international	order	with	the	United	States	as	the	core,	and	touch	the	
core	interests	of	the	United	States.	The	socialist	road	with	Chinese	characteristics	has	become	
an	authoritarian	system	in	the	eyes	of	the	West;	The	socialist	market	economy	with	Chinese	
characteristics	 is	 regarded	 as	 "state	 capitalism"	 and	 the	 greatest	 threat	 to	 the	 free	market	
economy;	The	"the	Belt	and	Road"	initiative	and	the	idea	of	building	a	community	with	a	shared	
future	for	mankind	are	considered	to	be	the	expansion	of	Chinese	imperialism.	As	an	important	
country	in	the	world	and	a	developing	country	with	the	largest	population,	China's	peaceful	and	
stable	development	and	poverty	reduction	miracle	are	the	well‐being	of	all	mankind;	However,	
these	great	achievements	and	great	country	responsibilities	that	should	have	won	wide	respect	
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and	 applause	 are	 regarded	 as	 "eyenails	 and	 thorns	 in	 the	 flesh"	 by	 hegemonists	 and	
unilateralists.	When	the	United	States	gradually	emerged	from	the	quagmire	of	anti‐terrorism,	
it	found	that	the	world	is	no	longer	the	same	as	it	used	to	be.	Hegemonism	and	unilateralism	
have	 become	 incompatible	 with	 the	 theme	 of	 win‐win	 cooperation	 in	 the	 world.	 China's	
multilateralism	and	the	diplomatic	concept	of	comprehensive	opening	and	cooperation,	with	
the	 help	 of	 comprehensive	 national	 strength,	 have	 become	 the	 source	 of	 nourishing	 global	
governance,	making	China's	influence	increasingly	prominent,	This	has	obviously	shaken	the	
foundation	of	the	United	States'	absolute	voice	in	the	global	governance	system.	In	this	regard,	
the	 relatively	moderate	 Obama	 administration	 has	 formulated	 the	 plan	 of	 returning	 to	 the	
Pacific,	which	represents	that	the	strategic	focus	of	the	United	States	has	begun	to	shift,	and	its	
pertinence	 is	self‐evident;	After	 the	tough	Trump	government	came	to	power,	 they	were	on	
pins	and	needles	in	the	face	of	an	increasingly	powerful	China;	At	last,	they	did	not	hesitate	to	
crack	the	skin,	and	began	to	crack	down	on	China	crazily	by	means	of	trade	wars	and	various	
sanctions	 in	 the	 name	 of	 "unnecessary".	 In	 order	 to	 restore	 the	 absolute	 dominance	 of	 the	
United	States	in	the	global	governance	system,	the	Trump	government	ignored	international	
norms	 and	 moral	 principles,	 overdrawed	 national	 credit,	 and	 reversed	 itself,	 openly	
confronting	 China,	 worsening	 the	 global	 governance	 environment.	 The	 concept	 of	 win‐win	
development	 has	 become	 fragile	 in	 the	 face	 of	 hegemonists.	 Realism	 is	 rampant.	
Comprehensive	 confrontation	 has	 replaced	 practical	 cooperation.	 China	 no	 longer	 has	 an	
external	environment	for	peaceful	and	stable	development.	

3.2. We	will	create	a	more	secure,	stable	and	harmonious	internal	
development	environment,	fully	tap	the	internal	development	potential,	
and	eliminate	the	impact	of	the	deterioration	of	the	external	environment	
through	the	eradication	of	crime.	

China	is	in	a	period	of	transition	to	a	market	economy	and	a	modern	society,	which	is	also	a	
period	of	great	adjustment	of	the	pattern	of	group	interests	and	a	necessary	stage	for	social	and	
economic	development.	As	long	as	the	interests	involved	are	adjusted,	all	kinds	of	problems	and	
contradictions	will	 inevitably	 erupt,	which	will	 often	 give	 the	mafia	 an	 opportunity	 to	 take	
advantage	of.	They	used	social	contradictions	to	incite	the	masses	who	did	not	know	the	truth	
to	attack	the	government	and	shake	the	regime;	Connect	with	corrupt	officials,	break	laws	and	
commit	crimes,	and	seek	improper	profits.	Their	actions	have	greatly	damaged	public	power	
and	the	credibility	of	the	government.	They	wantonly	seized	the	interests	of	the	country	and	
the	 people	 by	 illegal	means,	 thus	 depriving	 the	 people	 of	 their	 sense	 of	 security	 and	 gain,	
fundamentally	 shaking	 the	 socialist	 system,	 destroying	 the	 situation	 of	 stability	 and	 unity,	
hindering	the	normal	production	and	life	of	society,	and	deteriorating	the	internal	development	
environment.	
At	this	stage,	the	objective	situation	at	home	and	abroad	urgently	requires	us	to	further	tap	the	
potential	 of	 internal	 development,	 create	 a	 fair,	 just,	 harmonious	 and	 stable	 business	
environment	in	an	all‐round	way,	and	enhance	our	ability	to	resist	external	risks	with	a	healthy	
"internal	circulation".	Although	China's	social	security	has	been	generally	safe	and	stable	for	a	
long	time,	we	need	to	see	that	the	long‐term	rapid	economic	development	has	covered	up	some	
contradictions;	These	contradictions	will	be	exposed	 in	 the	process	of	 economic	 slowdown,	
sluggish	transformation	of	new	and	old	drivers	of	development	and	continuous	deterioration	
of	the	external	environment.	These	problems	are	often	magnified	and	used	by	the	mafia	forces,	
causing	turbulence	and	 irreversible	 losses	to	 the	country.	We	must	 increase	the	supply	side	
reform	 in	 the	 field	 of	 social	 security	 and	 provide	 a	 safer,	more	 just	 and	more	 harmonious	
production	and	living	environment	to	meet	people's	aspirations	for	a	better	life.	Through	the	
special	 fight	 against	 crime,	 we	 can	 combine	 the	 fight	 against	 crime	 with	 the	 fight	 against	
corruption,	 so	 as	 to	 clean	 the	body,	 clean	 the	door,	 and	 achieve	 the	 goal	 of	 practicing	hard	
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internal	skills	and	laying	a	solid	foundation.	Only	in	this	way	can	we	cope	with	the	changes	of	
various	external	environments	more	calmly.	

4. Theoretical	Logic,	Anti	Crime	and	Eliminating	Evil	Escort	The	
Realization	of	The	Great	Rejuvenation	of	The	Chinese	Nation	

The	essence	of	a	better	life	is	to	enhance	people's	sense	of	gain,	happiness	and	security.	The	
purpose	 of	 the	CPC	 is	 to	 serve	 the	people	wholeheartedly	 and	 lead	 the	people	 of	 all	 ethnic	
groups	to	realize	the	great	rejuvenation	of	the	Chinese	nation	faster	and	better,	which	is	the	
current	historical	mission	of	the	CPC.	

4.1. To	carry	out	the	special	fight	against	crime	can	further	consolidate	the	
foundation	for	the	people	to	live	and	work	in	peace	and	contentment,	and	
build	a	harmonious	and	unified	social	order	to	the	greatest	extent.	

Marx	pointed	out	that	"rules	and	order	itself	are	essential	elements	for	any	mode	of	production	
that	 acquires	 social	 fixity	 and	 social	 independence	 without	 mere	 contingency	 and	
arbitrariness."	 All	 kinds	 of	 underworld	 forces	 are	 malignant	 tumors	 that	 affect	 social	
development,	progress,	harmony	and	order,	seriously	endanger	the	people's	personal	rights,	
property	rights	and	personality	rights,	seriously	erode	and	damage	the	fundamental	interests	
of	the	overwhelming	majority	of	the	people,	and	hinder	the	realization	of	the	people's	sense	of	
gain,	happiness	and	security.	According	to	Maslow's	hierarchy	of	needs	theory,	the	classic	value	
theory	of	western	society,	security	is	the	basic	need	of	human	beings,	and	realizing	self	value	is	
the	highest	demand.	The	highest	ideal	of	Marxism	is	to	realize	the	freedom	and	liberation	of	all	
mankind.	No	matter	the	theoretical	viewpoints	of	capitalism	or	communism,	the	realization	of	
the	 highest	 value	 of	 human	 beings	 as	 defined	 by	 them	 all	 needs	 a	 basic	 premise	 ‐	 human	
possession	of	security.	The	CPC	is	a	supporter	of	Marxism.	As	a	Marxist	party,	it	has	a	natural	
rejection	of	all	kinds	of	ugly	phenomena	that	undermine	human	freedom	and	liberation.	Only	
by	fundamentally	removing	all	the	soil	that	destroys	the	order,	such	as	the	underworld	forces,	
can	we	build	a	good	social	ecology	that	strives	for	the	great	rejuvenation	of	the	Chinese	nation.	

4.2. To	carry	out	the	special	fight	against	crime	is	a	reflection	of	the	further	
improvement	of	the	national	governance	system	and	an	inevitable	
requirement	for	the	modernization	of	the	national	governance	capacity.	

No	benefit	is	greater	than	cure,	and	no	harm	is	greater	than	disorder.	It	is	an	important	way	to	
modernize	the	country's	governance	ability	to	carry	out	the	special	fight	against	mafia	and	evil.	
In	the	period	of	social	transformation,	various	contradictions	and	problems	are	intertwined,	so	
we	need	to	grasp	the	important	entry	point	to	solve	the	problems	and	contradictions,	so	that	
we	 can	 carry	 out	 point	 to	 area,	 and	 achieve	 individual	 breakthroughs.	 Only	 by	 addressing	
specific	outstanding	issues	can	we	comprehensively	promote	the	further	improvement	of	the	
national	 governance	 system	 and	 lay	 a	 solid	 foundation	 for	 the	 modernization	 of	 national	
governance.	 The	mafia	 forces	 are	 rampant	 in	 some	 regions	 and	 industries,	 and	 a	 series	 of	
people's	strong	reactions,	such	as	the	"umbrella"	playing	the	role	of	the	devil,	have	seriously	
affected	 the	 socialist	 fairness	 and	 justice.	 Whether	 the	 outstanding	 problems	 can	 be	
fundamentally	contained	and	solved	as	soon	as	possible	is	an	important	manifestation	of	the	
ruling	ability	of	our	party	 in	the	new	period,	and	an	important	step	in	the	modernization	of	
national	governance.	Only	when	we	quickly	 cut	 through	 the	mess	on	key	 issues,	use	severe	
punishment	to	cure	the	disease,	and	establish	a	long‐term	prevention	and	control	mechanism,	
can	we	achieve	a	key	breakthrough	in	national	governance,	win	the	support	and	trust	of	the	
broad	masses	of	the	people,	and	win	the	great	victory	of	socialist	construction	in	an	all‐round	
way.	
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4.3. Carrying	out	the	special	fight	against	crime	is	a	necessary	condition	for	the	
realization	of	the	"four	comprehensives"	and	the	smooth	progress	of	the	
"four	great".	

No	rules,	no	square.	To	carry	out	the	special	fight	against	crime	is	an	inevitable	requirement	for	
comprehensively	administering	the	country	according	to	law;	It	is	an	important	guarantee	for	
building	a	moderately	prosperous	society	in	an	all‐round	way	and	deepening	reform	in	an	all‐
round	way;	It	is	the	concrete	embodiment	of	comprehensively	and	strictly	governing	the	Party;	
It	is	an	important	link	in	the	fight	against	corruption.	If	we	do	not	root	out	the	evil	forces,	we	
cannot	stop	the	corruption	of	the	ruling	body,	prevent	the	occurrence	of	ugly	phenomena,	and	
show	the	superiority	of	the	socialist	system	in	an	all‐round	way.	The	special	fight	against	crime	
is	an	important	starting	point	to	achieve	the	credibility	of	the	Party	and	the	government.	Only	
by	comprehensively	purifying	the	social	environment	can	we	bring	about	the	cohesion	of	the	
people	 and	 the	 combat	 effectiveness	 of	 party	 members	 and	 cadres;	 Only	 by	 creating	 a	
harmonious,	orderly,	stable	and	united	atmosphere	can	the	people	of	all	ethnic	groups	in	the	
country	work	together	with	one	heart	and	one	mind	to	carry	out	great	struggles,	build	great	
projects,	promote	great	undertakings	and	realize	great	dreams.	

4.4. To	carry	out	the	special	struggle	against	crime	is	an	important	guarantee	
for	the	security	of	state	power	and	an	urgent	requirement	for	the	great	
rejuvenation	of	the	Chinese	nation.	

Like	water	without	a	source	and	the	end	of	a	foundation,	without	the	ruling	foundation	of	the	
Party,	the	security	of	state	power	cannot	be	guaranteed,	the	people's	democratic	dictatorship	
cannot	be	realized,	and	the	fundamental	interests	of	the	people	cannot	be	guaranteed.	In	order	
to	 realize	 the	 Chinese	 Dream	 of	 the	 great	 rejuvenation	 of	 the	 Chinese	 nation,	 we	 must	
thoroughly	eliminate	all	the	ugly	phenomena	that	hinder	the	progress,	development,	harmony	
and	stability	of	social	civilization,	and	the	evil	 forces	are	the	most	typical	representatives	of	
these	ugly	phenomena.	Carrying	out	the	special	fight	against	crime	is	an	important	entry	point	
to	ensure	the	security	of	the	state	power,	a	key	measure	to	promote	the	comprehensive	strict	
governance	of	the	Party,	an	important	link	to	purify	the	political	ecology,	an	inevitable	option	
to	consolidate	the	foundation	of	governance,	and	an	urgent	requirement	and	required	action	to	
achieve	the	national	dream	of	the	great	rejuvenation	of	the	Chinese	nation	faster	and	better.	
Realizing	 the	 great	 rejuvenation	 of	 the	 Chinese	 nation	 is	 a	 long‐term	 and	 arduous	 process,	
which	requires	a	variety	of	positive	factors	to	resonate	with	each	other	at	the	same	frequency,	
and	a	stable,	united,	harmonious	and	orderly	atmosphere	for	entrepreneurship.	This	kind	of	
atmosphere	does	not	exist	naturally.	We	must	give	play	to	our	subjective	initiative	and	create	
it	by	solving	various	contradictions	and	difficulties.	And	anti	crime	is	a	must	for	us	to	pursue	
our	dreams,	 and	we	have	no	 right	 to	make	mistakes.	Having	 said	 goodbye	 to	 suffering	 and	
humiliation,	the	Chinese	people,	nourished	by	the	continuous	Chinese	civilization,	have	never	
been	 intimidated	or	defeated.	 "The	general	 trend	of	 the	world	 is	overwhelming.	Those	who	
follow	the	trend	will	prosper	and	those	who	go	against	it	will	perish."	The	wheel	of	history	will	
eventually	crush	those	who	go	against	it.	Always	regard	the	realization	of	human	freedom	and	
liberation	as	the	highest	ideal,	consciously	use	the	Marxist	position,	viewpoint	and	the	Party's	
purpose	and	concept	 to	penetrate	and	understand	 the	principles	and	policies	of	 the	central	
government;	 We	 should	 be	 more	 committed	 to	 the	 "two	 safeguards"	 and	 the	 new	 era	 of	
socialism	with	Chinese	characteristics,	and	contribute	to	the	early	realization	of	the	Chinese	
Dream	of	the	great	rejuvenation	of	the	Chinese	nation.	
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